
C A P A B I L I T Y  S T A T E M E N T



A b o u t  U s
Victor Security is one of Australia’s leading Managed Security Services 

company that has been making sure clients and businesses all over the 

country feel secure and protected when it comes to asset protection and 

minimising risk. When working with Victor Security, living up to your 

expectations and trust is placed at the highest level.

Victor Security has a team of immensely capable and professional 

individuals that have been providing our services to clients with the best 

of the abilities. We take immense care and follow due process to ensure 

that each member on our team goes through a thorough background 

check. 

Our mission is to make sure businesses and individuals across Australia 

don’t have to worry about uncertainties and risks that prevail around the 

world. Victor Security makes sure your future is protected by providing 

services that go above and beyond to mitigating any risks or blind spots 

that can arise while running a business.

In an ideal world everyone would feel safe while going shopping, 

transporting valuables from one place to another, or not have fears 

about any potential threats, but that is not the world we live in. however, 

it doesn’t mean you can’t take steps to protect your workplace, 

employees, and assets from any risks or unforeseen threats.

Victor Security provides you with Security services that will prevent any 

false alarms or potential risks in the present, for a safer, protected future. 



Victor Security provides a whole range of managed security 

services for business small and big all over Australia. 

Irrespective of your industry, the solutions and services at 

Victor Security can be implemented to ensure your 

employees and customers feel safe and secure while 

conducting business.

Here is a quick rundown of all the services we provide.

SUPPLY GUARDS

Security Guards recruited by Victor Security undergo a 

tedious selection process which includes police 

clearance, probity, numeracy and literacy tests, along 

with undergoing training for core competencies. All our 

guards ensure they embody a professional attitude and 

are prepared to meet with any situation and provide an 

adequate response.

Our guards are trained to ensure they can take control of 

any escalated situation, identify potential threats, 

vandalism, any safety risks and provide clients with 

services that fit their requests as well.

RETAIL (VENUES / EVENTS) 

Victor Security has a team of capable individuals that 

have been trained with skills and core competencies that 

equip them to handle and manage any large venues or 

events happening in doors or outside.

From providing venue security, controlling a large crowd, 

personnel that are equipped to interact professionally 

and nicely with guests, or close protection for VIP or VVIP 

guests, Victor Security can manage it all. 
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ASSET PROTECTION

Asset protection is vital for businesses that require 

securing their financial, data, device, or other 

components of their organisations. Victor Security 

understands the complexities that are involved in 

managing and protecting assets in a volatile and 

uncertain world.

We design and customise our solutions taking in view the 

industry our clients work in that allows Victor Security to 

better manage expectations and mitigate potential risks.

PRIORITY SERVICES

Victor Security is equipped to provide 24/7 priority 

security services for retail shops, data sensitive facilities, 

corporations, and venues. Not only do we have the 

capabilities to provide personnel on ground, but 

technological solutions as well that observe and alert 

regarding any unforeseen activity or potential threats.

Trust Victor Security to plan ahead in time for a better, 

safe, and protected future for your business and 

customers. 
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We live in an extremely volatile, uncertain, and 

unpredictable world. Running a business in an environment 

where you can’t predict how markets will react the next 

minute or how a global event can stop the world as we know 

it, makes business owners and companies stop in the steps 

and evaluate how they can tackle such conditions.

As a managed security services company, Victor Security 

aims at providing clients with a sense of ease and assurance 

that their employees and assets are in good hands. We work 

with clients to provide them customised, actionable plans 

that will ensure that no matter which sector or industry they 

run a business in, their employees are always protected.

We offer safety management programs that includes 

training, testing procedures, and equipment that will enable 

our clients to make sure their employees and the community 

they operate out of are protected. 

For Victor Security, no business goal or technical objective is 

more important than the health or safety of our employees 

which places us at a reliable position to deliver the same 

principles and values to our clients while providing them a 

safety protocol strategy. 
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Our Clients Are 
Important To Us

Victor Security isn’t just a security 
services provider that makes sure our 
clients are fully protected against 
potential risks, threats or unforeseen 
events. We are a company that builds 
relationships with clients on the basis of 
trust, professionalism and to enable 
each other to grow for more success.

Being a managed security services 
provider has allowed Victor Security to 
gain the foresight and experience to 
handle escalated situations and 
circumstances where the potential for 
anything to go wrong is high. Our 

experience has allowed us to have a 
keen insight into what measures and 
steps we need to take in order to 
ensure our clients and their interests 
are always protected.

Whether our clients need security 
personnel for themselves, their 
premises or events, we hire individuals 
that go through heavy screening and 
background checks. Similarly, asset 
protection, providing 24/7 priority 
service and safety management for 
employees are all the many services we 
provide.



Victor Security is one of Australia’s 

leading managed security services 

providers that has been making sure 

clients all over the country are 

protected from any potential risks, 

threats and uncertainties.

We work with clients to come up with 

customised safety management and 

asset protection strategies that enable 

us to make better decisions in real time 

without sacrificing on security.

No matter which industry or sector your 

c o n t a c t  u s business operates in, or how small or 

big your team is Victor Security has a 

security solution for everyone.

We provide 24/7 priority services, 

supply security personnel for events, 

venues, office premises and more, and 

asset protection as well.

Victor Security aims at cultivating trust 

and forging professional relationships, 

with our clients and if you are a 

company that needs security services 

for any area of your business, contact 

Victor Security today for an experience 

that will reassure all your fears and 

worries.

VICTOR SECURITY


